BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258

JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.aIIs, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY

Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
POLICE DEPARTMENT
OFFICER SHIRTS
Flying Cross® Justice Men’s Long Sleeve 75% Poly / 25% Wool Shirt 130 | S 65.00( S 8,450.00| $ 59.75| S 7,767.50| $ 70.00( S 9,100.00
Flying Cross® Justice Women’s Long Sleeve 75% Poly / 25% Wool Shirt 5 S 83.22( S 416.10| $ 54.75( $ 273.75| $ 70.00( $ 350.00
Flying Cross® Justice Men’s Short Sleeve 75% Poly / 25% Wool Shirt 130 | S 60.00( S 7,800.00| $ 54.00( S 7,020.00| $ 65.00( S 8,450.00
Flying Cross® Justice Women’s Short Sleeve 75% Poly / 25% Wool Shirt 5 S 77.00( S 385.00 | $ 49.25| $ 246.25 | $ 65.00( $ 325.00
Flying Cross® Base Layer Mock Turtleneck Shirt, 92% Cotton 8% LYCRA 20 S 32.00| $ 640.00 | $ 27.00| $ 540.00 | $ 35.00| $ 700.00
Attach Hash Marks Left Forearm (#) included included included
Attach Sergeant Chevrons, both sleeves included included included
Alterations included included included
OFFICER TROUSERS & SHORTS
Flying Cross® Justice Men’s 4-Pocket 75% Poly / 25% Wool Pants 20 |S 81.40| S 1,628.00( $ 63.50| $ 1,270.00| $ 80.00( $ 1,600.00
Flying Cross® Justice Women’s 4-Pocket 75% Poly / 25% Wool Pants 5 S 81.40| $ 407.00| $ 84.75| $ 423.75| $ 80.00| $ 400.00
Flying Cross® Justice Men’s Cargo 75% Poly / 25% Wool Pants 200 | S 87.65| S 17,530.00| $ 73.25( S  14,650.00( S 95.00( S  19,000.00
Flying Cross® Justice Women’s Cargo 75% Poly / 25% Wool Pants 20 S 90.00( S 1,800.00| S 73.25( $ 1,465.00| $ 95.00( $ 1,900.00
Flying Cross® Valor Men’s Cargo Pocket 65% Poly / 35% Cotton Shorts S 68.00| S -1s 50.00| S -1s 65.00| S -
Flying Cross® Valor Women’s Cargo Pocket 65% Poly/35% Cotton Shorts S 68.00| S -1s 50.00| S -1s 65.00| S -
5.11 Men’s Stryke™ Pants 30 S 70.00| S 2,100.00| S 55.75( $ 1,672.50( $ 53.00( $ 1,590.00
5.11 Women’s Stryke™ Pants S 75.00] S -1S 55.75| S -1S 53.00| S -
OFFICER OUTERWEAR
Spiewak WeatherTech Systems Duty Jacket 15 S  100.00( S 1,500.00( $ 106.25] S 1,593.75| $ 125.00] S 1,875.00
Spiewak Performance Soft Shell Liner/Jacket w/ Side Zipper added 15 S 97.90( S 1,468.50| S 92.25( S 1,383.75( $ 110.00( S 1,650.00
Spiewak WeatherTech Hi-Vis Revers Duty Jacket ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 15 S 144.00( S 2,160.00| S 138.25] S 2,073.75| S 150.00] S 2,250.00
Spiewak WeatherTech Tactical Response Rain Pant 2 S 131.00 $ 262.00| S 117.50| $ 235.00| S 125.00| $ 250.00
Spiewak VizGuard Short Revers Duty Rain Jacket ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 2 S  106.00| S 212.00| S 91.50| $ 183.00| S 95.00| $ 190.00
Spiewak VizGuard Long Reversible Duty Raincoat ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 10 S 110.00| S 1,100.00( $ 99.25[ S 99250 S 105.00| $ 1,050.00
HONOR GUARD UNIFORMS
Flying Cross Command Men’s Single Breasted Dress Coat 3 S 160.00( $ 480.00 | $ 135.00| $ 405.00( $ 130.00| $ 390.00
Flying Cross Command Men’s 4-Pocket Pants 3 S 45.00| S 135.00| S 35.00| S 105.00| S 35.00| S 105.00




BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258
JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.alls, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY

Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
Clarino Dress Belt S 60.00| S -1S 24.50| S -1S 55.00| S -
Dutyman Brass Dress Belt Buckle S 355] S -1s 3.25| S -1s 400| S -
Van Heusen Long Sleeve Button Down Oxford Shirt S 17.95| S - no bid S 20.00| S -
Van Heusen Short Sleeve Button Down Oxford Shirt S 16.35( S - no bid $ 18.00( $ -
Samuel Broome Polyester 3” Clip-On Tie with Buttonholes, 18” S 4.00| S -1S 7.25| S -1S 7.00| S -
Gorgonz Winter Ear Muffs S 7.00| S - no bid no bid
Round Rain Cap Cover for Midway 4-Star Cap 10 S 3.00( S 30.00| S 450]| S 45.00| S 4.00( S 40.00
Midway Gold Hatband Expansion 2 S 6.00( S 12.00| $ 9.00( $ 18.00| $ 10.00| S 20.00
Midway Nickel Hatband Expansion 7 S 6.00| S 42.00| S 9.00( S 63.00| $ 10.00( S 70.00
Gold (P) Cap Buttons, pair included S 1.50 S 2.50| S -
Bates Lite Hi-Gloss Oxford Shoe S 55.00| S -1S 63.00] S -1S 45.00| S -
US Flag Bar S 450| S -1s 7.00] S -3 11.83| S -
Nameplate Gold 3 S 11.50( $ 34.50| S 15.50( $ 46.50| S 1161 $ 34.83
Gold Stripe Collar Brass S 6.40| S -1s 7.25] S -1s 5.88] S -
Cotton Dress Gloves, white S 4.00| S - 1S 8.25| § -1s 10.28( §$ -
Clarino Cuff Case with Brass Snap S 23.50| S -1s 22.00| S -3 20.00| S -
Dutyman Leather Holster G17-19 S 64.25]| S -1S 65.00| S -1s 60.00| S -
Braided Shoulder Cord 5 S 6.12] S 30.60| S 13.50( S 67.50| $ 7.34( S 36.70
Clothing Bag included no bid S 2.50| S -
SRT UNIFORMS
Tru-Spec 24/7 Ultralight Long Sleeve Poly/Cotton Ripstop Shirt S 42.00( $ -1s 3575 S -1s 50.00| S -
Tru-Spec 24/7 Ultralight Short Sleeve Poly/Cotton Ripstop Shirt S 37.00| S -1s 34.25| S -3 45.00| $ -
Uniform Name Tape, w/ Velcro Hook S 5.00 S -1S 1.25] S -1S 4.00| § -
Velcro Hook Applied to Name Tape S 1.00| $ - included included
Tru-Spec Poly/Cotton Ripstop Cargo Pant 8 S 38.00| S 304.00 | S 35.75| S 286.00 | S 40.00| $ 320.00
Tru-Spec Tactical Response Uniform Shirt, 65/35 Poly/Cotton, Multicam S 55.00| S 110.00 | S 65.00| S 130.00| $ 50.00| $ 100.00
Tru-Spec Tactical Resp. Uniform Cargo Pant, 65/35 Poly/Cotton, Multi 2 S 55.00| S 110.00| S 65.00| S 130.00| S 55.00| S 110.00
5.11 Multicam Rapid Assault L/S Shirt, S-2XL 12 S 62.00| $ 744.00 | $ 59.75| S 717.00| $ 60.00| $ 720.00
5.11 Multicam Rapid Assault L/S Shirt, 3XL S 65.00| S -1S 63.50| S -1S 70.00| S -




BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258
JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.alls, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY

Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
5.11 Aggressor 3-in-1 parka, Coyote; XS-2XL S 213.00( S -1S 198.50| S -1S 185.00| S -
5.11 Aggressor 3-in-1 parka, Coyote; 3XL S 245.00| S -1S 198.50( $ -1S 200.00( $ -
K-9 UNIFORMS - COLOR FOR ALL IS MIDNIGHT NAVY (750)
5.11 Stryke PDU Men’s LS Class A Shirt 2 S 73.00| $ 146.00 | S 63.50| $ 127.00( $ 75.00| $ 150.00
5.11 Stryke PDU Men’s LS Class B Shirt S 73.00] S -1S 63.50| S -1S 75.00| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Men’s SS Class A Shirt 1 S 73.00| S 73.00| $ 63.50( $ 63.50| S 75.00( $ 75.00
5.11 Stryke PDU Men’s SS Class B Shirt S 73.00] S -1S 63.50| S -1S 75.00] S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Women’s LS Class A Shirt S 71.00| S -1s 63.50| S -3 70.00| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Women'’s LS Class B Shirt S 71.00] S -1S 63.50]| S -1s 70.00| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Women'’s SS Class A Shirt S 71.00| S -1s 63.50| S -3 70.00| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Women’s SS Class B Shirt S 71.00] S -1S 63.50| S -1S 70.00| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Men’s Class A Pant 3 S 71.00| $ 213.00( $ 63.50| $ 190.50 | $ 60.00( $ 180.00
5.11 Stryke PDU Men’s Class B Pant S 71.00] S -1S 63.50| S -1S 60.00]| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Women'’s Class A Pant S 71.00| S -1s 63.50| S -3 60.00| $ -
5.11 Stryke PDU Women’s Class B Pant S 71.00] S -1S 63.50]| S -1S 60.00]| S -
5.11 Stryke PDU Flashlight Pocket Kit S 10.00| S -1s 8.00| S - no bid
BIKE UNIT UNIFORMS
Horace Small Cotton Blend Short Sleeve Polo Shirt, Spec Ops 20 |S 35.00| $ 700.00 | $ 35.00| $ 700.00 | $ 42.00( $ 840.00
Horace Small Cotton Blend Long Sleeve Polo Shirt, Spec Ops 3 S 40.00| S 120.00| S 35.00| S 105.00| S 46.00( S 138.00
5.11 Patrol Short 3 S 59.00| $ 177.00| S 47.75| S 143.25( $ 50.00| $ 150.00
HEADWEAR
Midway Officer Dress Hat, 4-Star, Round Nvy 15 S 40.00| S 600.00 | $ 38.25( $ 573.75 no bid
Midway Sgt Dress Hat, 4-Star, Round Navy 2 S 40.00( S 80.00| $ 39.75| S 79.50 no bid
Midway Lieutenant Dress Hat, 4-Star Cap, Round Navy 2 S 40.00( S 80.00| S 39.75| S 79.50 no bid
Midway Captain / Dept. Chief / Chief Dress Hat, Round Navy 2 S 75.00| S 150.00 | S 77.00| $ 154.00 no bid
Fairfield Line Stocking Cap S 6.00| S -1S 22.50| S -1s 8.00| S -
5.11 Fleece Watch Cap 8 S 14.00| $ 112.00| S 12.00| $ 96.00| S 12.00 $ 96.00
BELTS
1%” Boston Leather Black BW Belt | 1 [s 1740(s 1740 $  1350($ 1350/ 1800($ 18.00




BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258
JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.alls, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY

Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
1 %” Boston Leather Black BW Belt S 14.80| $ -1S 12.00( §$ - no bid
5.11 Zero G Plates S 81.00| S -1S 79.50( S -1s 75.00| S -
TIES
Samuel Broome 3.5” x 18” Clip-on Tie with Buttonholes 5 S 4.00] S 20.00| S 7.25] S 36.25| S 7.00] S 35.00
Samuel Broome 3.5” x 20” Clip-on Tie with Buttonholes 5 S 4.00( S 20.00| S 7.25( S 36.25| S 7.00( S 35.00
OTHER MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
5.11 Chameleon Jacket, Black, sz S-2XL S 118.00( S -1S 103.75] S -1s 96.00| S -
5.11 Chameleon Jacket, Black, cs 3XL S 125.00| $ -|s 121.00| S -1 112.00| S -
Blauer Fleece Sweater, Navy, sz XS-2XL S 98.00| S -1S 105.00| S -1S 100.00| S -
Blauer Fleece Sweater, Navy, sz 3XL-4XL S 120.00] $ -|s 129.75 S -1 120.00| S -
Blauer Fleece Sweater, Navy, sz 5XL S  160.00| S -1S 169.75] S - no bid
Under Armor Coldgear Tactical Mock, Navy S 45.00| S -3 47.75| $ - no bid
5.11 Stryke Pant, Khaki S 65.00| S -1S 65.00| S -1s 60.00| S -
5.11 Short Sleeve Performance Polo, Dark Navy S 33.00| S -1s 34.75| S -3 32.00| S -
5.11 Trainer Belt, Black, sz S-2XL S 35.00| S -1S 34.75| S -1s 32.00] S -
5.11 Trainer Belt, Black, sz 3XL-4XL S 40.00| S -1s 40.00| S -1s 37.00| S -




BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258
JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.aIIs, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY

Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
FIRE DEPARTMENT
SHIRTS - price includes attachment of two (2) emblems supplied by the Fire Department
Long Sleeve, Lt Blue, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/40z), Liberty #722 MLB 20 S 24.00| S 480.00| $ 26.00| S 520.00| S 33.00| S 660.00
Short Sleeved, Light Blue, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/40z), Liberty #732 MLB 20 S 22.00| S 440.00| S 24.00| S 480.00| S 30.00| $ 600.00
Long Sleeved, White, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/40z), Liberty #722 MWH 25 S 23.00| S 575.00 | S 25.00| S 625.00| S 30.00| S 750.00
Short Sleeved, White, 65/35 poly/cotton (5-1/40z), Liberty #732 MWH 25 S 20.00| S 500.00 | $ 21.75( $ 543.75| $ 28.00| $ 700.00
1/4 Zip Job Shirt, Navy, 80/20 cotton/poly fleece 11.60z, 511 Tactical #72314 40 S 56.25( S 2,250.00| S 54.75| $ 2,190.00| S 60.00( S 2,400.00
PANTS
Straight Leg, Navy Blue, Dickie style #874 20 S 20.00| S 400.00| $ 20.75| S 415.00| $ 25.00| S 500.00
Uniform Pant, Navy Blue, Fechheimer class 'A' #38200 25 S 44.00| S 1,100.00( S 39.00( $ 975.00| $ 40.00| S 1,000.00
EMT Pant, men's, Navy, Propper #F5221-14-412, Tru Spec 24x7 #1125, #1061 100 S 34.00( S 3,400.00| S 39.00( S 3,900.00| S 40.00| S 4,000.00
EMT Pant, women's, Navy, Propper #F528614, Tru Spec 24x7 #1125, #1095 10 S 34.00| S 340.00| $ 39.00| $ 390.00| $ 40.00| S 400.00
SHORTS
Men's, Navy Blue, TruSpec Ascent style #1108 15 S 34.00| $ 510.00 | $ 43.25[ S 648.75| $ 45.00( S 675.00
Women's, Navy Blue, TruSpec Ascent style #1119 5 S 40.00| S 200.00 | S 43.25] § 216.25| S 45.00| $ 225.00
JACKETS - pricing includes attachment of four (4) emblems supplied by the Fire Department
Spiewak S3616/5327 (29") or equal (outer jacket only - no liner) 10 S 100.00| $ 1,000.00( $ 117.75( S 1,177.50| $ 140.00( S 1,400.00
Spiewak Performance Soft Shell Jacket - Navy, $318Z-011 10 S 97.90| S 979.00| $ 95.25( $ 952.50| S 120.00( S 1,200.00
DRESS COAT
Fechheimer style #38804; Captain Pair of Yellow Stripes, Gold Buttons 2 |$ 17000[$s  34000[$ 12975|$  25950[$  13000[ §  260.00
SHOES
Bates High Gloss Uniform Oxford, HG #941 20 S 95.00| $ 1,900.00( $ 103.75| $ 2,075.00| S 96.00| $ 1,920.00
Bates #2261 Tactical Sport Side Zip 8" 5 S 82.00| S 410.00| $ 83.75| § 418.75| $ 77.50| S 387.50
Bates Low Cut Boot #2262 Tactical Sport 5 S 73.00| $ 365.00 | $ 75.75| $ 378.75( $ 70.00| $ 350.00
Bates #2263 8" Tactical Composite Toe Zip 5 S 94.00| S 470.00| $ 97.25| § 486.25| S 90.00| $ 450.00
Merrell Moab Ventilator 25 S 75.00| S 1,875.00 no bid S 85.00( $ 2,125.00
Rocky #2173 Alpha Force 8" Zip Waterproof Boot 5 S 85.00| S 425.00| $ 90.75| $ 453.75| $ 84.00| S 420.00
Rocky #5000 TMC Plain Toe Oxford 5 S 106.00| $ 530.00| S 112.50| $ 562.50| S 104.00| $ 520.00
Rocky #5001 TMC Athletic Oxford 5 S 109.00( $ 545.00 | S 116.75( $ 583.75| S 108.00( $ 540.00
Thorogood #834-6041 Uniform Leather Oxford 2 S 62.50( S 125.00| $ 57.75( $ 11550 $ 55.00( $ 110.00




BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258
JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.alls, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY
Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
Thorogood #834-6180 Athletic Oxford discontinued 2 S sluzlz)i)%ck; RKDOO;;().OO discontinued no bid
Thorogood #834-6218 6" Waterproof Side-Zip Boot 2 S 90.00| S 180.00 | S 86.50| $ 173.00| S 80.00| $ 160.00
Thorogood #834-6219 8" Zip Waterproof Boot 2 S 94.50| $ 189.00 | S 87.25| S 17450 S 83.00( $ 166.00
Code 6, 6" Side-zip Boot  discontinued 2 S F;‘;'gg REDOOSS/l 2,075.;0 no bid $ 80.00| ¢ 160.00
Code 6, 8" Side-zip Boot 2 S 84.00| $ 168.00 no bid S 90.00( S 180.00
Tactical Research 8" Waterproof Side-zip Boot (TR998Z WP) 2 S 111.00( $ 222.00] S 117.00| $ 234.00 no bid
Danner Station Office Boot, 6" black 2 S 116.00| S 232.00( S 135.00| $ 270.00 no bid
OTHER
uf;i;fl(z;i;é; Uniform Dress Hat; Midway Cap Company; Navy (Firefighters), 10 S 40.00| ¢ 400.00| ¢ 43.25| 432.50 ho bid
Belt - Boston Leather, 1 1/2" Off-Duty Leather Stitched Belt, Black, plain 25 S 16.00| S 400.00| $ 33.50| S 837.50| S 19.00( S 475.00
Traction Aids, price per pair, Due North All Purpose or equal S 30.00| S - no bid no bid
clip-on | S 4.25 S 8.25 S 6.00

Samuel Broome Tie - Black, 20", polyester, clip-on, zip-up, or tie options zip-up | S 8.00 S 8.25 no bid

tie |$ 4.25 $ 8.25 no bid
HAT AND COLLAR BRASS
Hat Brass (Firefighter) - bugle silver dress hat badge, Smith & Warren C192L 10 S 14.00( S 140.00| S 25.00| S 250.00 | S 22.00| S 220.00
Hat Brass (Captain) - Gold bands and buttons, Smith & Warren C192L 5 S 17.25( $ 86.25| $ 25.00( $ 125.00( S 19.00( $ 95.00
Hat Brass (Captain) — Gold hat badge, 2 bugles, Smith & Warren C110 5 S 17.25( S 86.25| $ 25.00| S 125.00| S 19.00( S 95.00
Hat Brass (BC/ADC/FM) — Gold hat badge, 3 crossed bugles, S & W C104 1 S 17.25| S 17.25| S 25.00( $ 25.00| $ 19.00| S 19.00
Hat Brass (AFM) — Gold hat badge, 2 crossed bugles, Smith & Warren C111 1 S 17.25( S 17.25( S 25.00| $ 25.00| $ 19.00( S 19.00
Hat Brass (Assistant Chief) — Gold hat badge, 4 crossed bugles, S & W C103 1 S 17.25| S 17.25| S 25.00( $ 25.00| $ 19.00| S 19.00
Hat Brass (Chief) — Gold hat badge, 5 crossed bugles, Smith & Warren C102 S 17.25( §$ -1S 25.00| S -18 19.00( §$ -
Lapel Brass (Captain) — 2 open bugles, Hero’s Pride 4444G 5 S 575] S 28.75| S 7.50] S 37.50| S 6.00] S 30.00
Lapel Brass (Asst. Fire Marshal) — 2 open crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4445G 1 S 5.75| S 5.75| S 7.50( S 7.50] S 6.00( S 6.00
Lapel Brass — 2 solid bars, Hero’s Pride 4411MG S 5.75| § -1s 7.50| § -1s 4.00| S -
Lapel Brass (Captain) — 2 solid bugles, Hero’s Pride 4451G 5 S 7.25( S 36.25| S 8.50( S 42.50] S 6.00| S 30.00
Lapel Brass (BC/ADC/FM) — 3 open crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4446G 2 S 575| S 11.50( $ 7.50] S 15.00( $ 6.00] S 12.00
Lapel Brass (BC/ADC/FM) — 3 solid crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4453G 2 S 7.25( S 14.50| S 8.50( S 17.00| S 6.00( S 12.00




BID TABULATION FORM
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Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.alls, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY

Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
Lapel Brass (Asst. Chief) — 4 open crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4447G 1 S 5.75| S 5.75| S 7.50( S 7.50] S 6.00( S 6.00
Lapel Brass (Asst. Chief) — 4 solid crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4454G 1 S 7.25| S 7.25| S 8.50| $ 8.50| S 6.00| S 6.00
Lapel Brass (Chief) — 5 open crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4448G S 5.75| S -1S 7.50| S -1S 6.00| S -
Lapel Brass (Chief) — 5 solid crossed bugles, Hero’s Pride 4455G S 7.25| S -1s 8.50| S -1s 6.00| S -
BADGES

Adm. District Chief — 3 crossed bugles w/ red background, Smith & Warren 2 S 68.00| S 136.00 | S 92.00( $ 184.00 no bid

Asst. Chief — 4 crossed bugles w/ red background, Smith & Warren 1 S 68.00| S 68.00| $ 92.00| $ 92.00 no bid

Asst. Fire Marshal — 2 crossed bugles w/ red background, Smith & Warren S 68.00| S -1s 92.00| S - no bid

Battalion Chief — 3 crossed bugles w/ red background, Smith & Warren 2 S 68.00| S 136.00| S 92.00| $ 184.00 no bid

Captain — 2 straight bugles, Smith & Warren 5 S 68.00| $ 340.00| $ 92.00( S 460.00 no bid

Captain Fire Investigator Eagle Top #5555B — Gold, Smith & Warren S 104.00| S -1S 92.00| S - no bid

Chief — 5 crossed bugles w/ red background, Smith & Warren S 70.00| S -1s 92.00| S - no bid

Fire Marshal — 3 crossed bugles w/ red background, Smith & Warren S 70.00| S -1S 92.00| S - no bid

Firefighter — silver, Smith & Warren 10 S 45.00| S 450.00| $ 61.75| S 617.50 no bid




BID TABULATION FORM
UNIFORM APPAREL FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPARTMENTS - RFB #PUR0619-258
JULY 9, 2019 @ 3:00 PM

Est Qty Kieck's Careen: Apparel Ray O'Herrc:')n Co., Inc. G.alls, LLC
Cedar Rapids, IA Danvile, IL Lexington, KY
Description Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
Total amount for estimated quantities bid by all vendors: S 70,016.10 $ 65,577.75 S  75,341.03
Certified Local Business? Yes No No
If local, certified small business? Yes n/a n/a
If local, % difference from low bid: 6.77% n/a n/a

Estimated lead time:

10 calendar days

14-28 calendar days

30 calendar days

Signature Page

Comments / Exceptions: None None None
Accept MasterCard? Yes Yes Yes
Quick pay discount: None None None




	Police & Fire Uniform Apparel

